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What is a story?



• Stories are composed of a set of 
phenomena and the interweaving 
between them. 

• When we tell stories, we tell them 
with paragraph breaks: We make 
the decision to group certain 
events together because we 
believe their phenomena share 
some sense of similarity, and we 
spend time discussing that group 
of events's content and import 
before moving on.



• We hang those paragraphs 
together into some larger global 
narrative structure, and that 
global structure usually has 
analytical import: We break the 
story into separable themes, a 
before vs. after, tell it as a story 
that moves over time, break it into 
alternating accounts of two 
contrasting groups, or so on. 

• Finally, no telling is neutral, and 
we deepen our analytic insight as 
we write, as we flesh out, 
investigate, and interrogate why 
our telling ought be the right one.
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What is a story of gender transition?







Data Collection



Coding

• Notes App 

• A "checkbox" app 

• Re-coded after one year



Linear ENA



Linear ENA



Linear ENA



What is a story of a transition?
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Modeling "Lumpy" Time







• Embed "elbows" with one-hot 
encoding: They go in the 
neighborhood where we expect a 
unit that only has that one 
connection to go 

• Embed the nodes to give some 
sense of global structure, using 
same optimization algorithm 
already used in linear ENA











Telling Stories of Transitions





























• How can QE be used to tell a 
temporal story? 

• My role as a QE researcher: Tell a 
rich qualitative story whose turns 
are guided by quantitative 
features 

• What I need is a model whose 
turns capture the "lumpiness" of 
time as a thing experienced 

• I need (1) a global narrative 
structrure and (2) paragraph 
"clusters" of events

• Transitions are "lumpy" 
experiences, and Nonlinear ENA 
can capture that
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